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NEW QUESTION: 1Your network contains an Active Directory domain named contoso.com. The
domain contains 100 servers. You deploy the Local Administrator Password Solution (LAPS) to
the network. You discover that the members of a group named FinanceAdministrators can view
the password of the local Administrator accounts on the servers in an organizational unit (OU)
named FinanceServers. You need to prevent the FinanceAdministrators members from viewing
the local administrators' passwords on the servers in FinanceServers. Which permission should
you remove from FinanceAdministrators?A. All extended rightsB. Read permissionsC. List
contentsD. Read all propertiesAnswer: AExplanation:
https://blogs.technet.microsoft.com/askpfeplat/2015/12/28/local-administrator-password-sol
ution-lapsimplementation-hints-and-security-nerd-commentaryincludingmini-threat-model/
Access to the password is granted via the "Control Access" right on the attribute. Control
Access is an "Extended Right" in Active Directory, which means if a user has been granted the
"All Extended Rights" permission they'll be able to see passwords even if you didn't give them
permission.

NEW QUESTION: 2
組織のデータ分類ポリシーに従ってデータへのアクセスを承認する責任は、次のものに属します。
A. 情報セキュリティマネージャーB. システム管理者。C. データエンドユーザーD. データ所有者
Answer: D

NEW QUESTION: 3Which three are true about the default database buffer cache? (Choose
three.)A. The keep and recycle cache memory is sub-allocated from memory allocated to the
default buffer cache.B. Its buffers can contain data block images for blocks that have a
corresponding image in a data file.C. It is in the fixed area of the SGA.D. Its buffers can contain
data block images for blocks that have no corresponding image in a data file.E. It can contain
block images only for database blocks whose block size is equal to the buffer size.F. Buffers
containing block images may be selected for reuse based only on a touch count algorithm.G.
Buffers containing block images may be selected for reuse based only on a Least Recently Used
(LRU) algorithm.Answer: A,C,D
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